‘T dRe & opla T g
T ar ( frm wen e ) &
i sy wae W.2-21-veler
e [ 13 R | fied, el
30-05-2001.”

Gl ¥R
“grfrerR/gi/0s/2013-2018.”

T 116 ] TG, 6N, i 22 Wrel 2018 — B 1, W 1940

fom fam
AT, WEFEt WaE, O

v gy, Rerien 22 W 2018
it

T T 2018-04-00428 T/ Pt fam, — W ¥ SRF & GHR 309 F W T W W A1 i3 o
TR, Uil & TSI, SRR, BRelteg R Qe (srew) e, 2010 3 Frefirfm sk sim w0 € s -

Lt
e ol &, -

o 1 8, g =l W v “aim ) o B R O, v R wirantis e,

No. L 2018-04-00428/Finance/Rules/IV. — In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to
Article 309 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Chhattisgarh, hereby, makes the following further amendment
in the Chhattisgarh Civil Services (Leave) Rules, 2010 namely :-

AMENDMENT
In the said rules,-

In rule 11, for the words “five years”, wherever they occur, the words “three years” shall be substituted.

GG & TSI & T Q AGT AR,
. %, o], vy el

131



232 ' GelREg T, i 22 90 2018

o T, fis 22 Al 2018
aftegen

TR T 2018-04-00428 /e /Fem /AR, — e & v 3 i 309 % Wi oINS vt #) i i R
T TR TSI, TR, Y Fram 7 Raafie ol s w@ €, ol -

Eos e
2 frit it -

o 2 &, averrg 3 &, P 187, v “im ¥ wm w, W “Himad” nitvenfya fem o,

No. L 2018-04-00428/Finance/Rules/IV. — In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to
Article 309 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Chhattisgarh, hereby, makes the following further amendment
* in the Chhattisgarh Fundamental Rules, namely :-
AMENDMENT
In the said rules,-

In Part IT, in Chapter 111, in rule 18, for the words “five years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted.

SR(r” & TR & T 8 T AR,
w. &, ww, sigw wim.

TR, T O fee wral, el T weeka s, e @ i e i - 2018,






